
The Custar 

Stone Co.

Stoneco-

Portage

Stone Size

Quantity 

(Tons) ** Unit Price Unit Price

No. 1 50 $12.50 $12.40

No. 2 50 $12.50 $12.40

No. 8 500 $13.25 $13.15

Washed No. 8 5000 $13.75 No Bid

No. 9 1000 $12.25 $11.50

Washed No. 9 300 $12.75 $11.50

Washed No. 89 1000 $14.00 No Bid

No. 57 50 $13.00 $12.70

No. 304 50 $9.75 $9.60

No. 310 50 $9.75 $9.60

No. 411 10000 $9.75 $9.85

No. 601D 1000 $18.25 $17.90

No. 601A, B, C 50 $20.75 No Bid

No. 617 50 $9.75 $9.85

Sand 50 $12.00 $9.00

Super Berm 50 $10.75 No Bid

 

2022 703 Aggregate Bid Tab

**The proposed quantities are for reference only and do 

not reflect the amount of aggregate the county intends or 

estimates to purchase.  


