
Letting Date: Monday, April 18, 2011 at 8:00 pm

Engr. Est Gerken Asphalt Paving, Inc. Ward Constr. HRM PS Constr Fabric Ernst Asphalt DG Slurry Seal J.C. Carr Constr Bergman

Section A: 2011 Patching, Resurfacing, Widening  & Berm $99,194.72 $95,752.80 no bid no bid no bid $54,404.45 no bid no bid $93,432.00

Section B: 2011 Seal & Chip $47,982.12 no bid $49,113.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $46,846.00

Section C: 2011 Crackseal 11,500.00$     no bid $12,300.00 $9,900.00 $17,400.00 no bid $10,500.00 $13,860.00 no bid

not signed wrong total

* Contracts awarded to: Gerken Asphalt, HRM and Ward Construction pending verification

If you have any questions regarding the award of contracts contact Bob Bostelman at 419-758-3376

Contracts will be mailed out once they are prepared.

NO WORK IS TO BE STARTED UNTIL CONTRACTS ARE SIGNED AND BOB BOSTELMAN IS NOTIFIED OF YOUR START DAY AND TIME. CONTRACTOR MUST NOTIFY BOSTELMAN 

AT LEAST 3 DAYS PRIOR TO STARTING.

Napoleon Township 2011 Road Improvements



Section A: 2011 Patching and Berming of Various Roads

estimate: $99194.72

Ref# Item# Qty Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 448 99 Ton Asphalt Concrete Interm. Course Type 1M 68.00$          6,732.00$                68.00$         6,732.00$          

  

2 448 712 Ton Asphalt Concrete Surface Course Type 1M 68.00$          48,416.00$              68.00$         48,416.00$        

  

3 448 75 Ton Asphalt Conc Surf Type 1M incl tack 125.00$        9,375.00$                90.00$         6,750.00$          

    * used for patching   

4 301 150 Tn Bituminous Agg Base widening 70.00$          10,500.00$              100.00$       15,000.00$        

    * included excavation activities   

5 617 441 Gal Bituminous Tack Coat 1.80$            793.80$                   2.00$           882.00$            

6 407 612 Ton Reconditioning Shoulders (berm) 28.00$          17,136.00$              21.00$         12,852.00$        

7 614 1 LS Maintain Traffic 1,200.00$     1,200.00$                500.00$       500.00$            

   

8 624 1 LS Mobilization 1,000.00$     1,000.00$                800.00$       800.00$            

  

9 103.05 1 LS Bond 600.00$        600.00$                   1,500.00$     1,500.00$          

TOTAL 95,752.80$              TOTAL 93,432.00$        TOTAL -$                     

Gerken Asphalt Paving Bergman



SECTION B: 2011 Chipseal CONTRACT 
Estimate: $47982.12

Ref# Item# Qty Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 409 56 Tn Seal Coat agg No. 8a (washed), applied 18.100$   1,013.60$   14.000$        784.00$           

and compacted at 21 lbs/ sy    

2 409 519 Gal Seal Coat agg No. 9a (washed), applied 18.100$   9,393.90$   14.000$        7,266.00$        
and compacted at 21 lbs/ sy   

3 409 17898 Gal Seal Coat, bitumninous material applied 2.100$     37,585.80$ 2.000$          35,796.00$      
as directed, varies    MWS90   

4 409S 6 Miles brooming finished pavement 45.000$   270.00$      100.000$      600.00$           
  

5 614 1 LS Maintaining Traffic 200.000$ 200.00$      800.000$      800.00$           
  

6 624 1 LS Mobilization 300.000$ 300.00$      800.000$      800.00$           
     

7 103.05 1 LS Bond 350.00$   350.00$      800.00$        800.00$           

TOTAL 49,113.30$ TOTAL 46,846.00$      TOTAL -$                    

WARD Constr. Bergman



SECTION C: 2011 Crackseal CONTRACT 
estimate: $11500.00

Ref# Item# Qty Unit Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 spec 10000 lbs Type IV Crack seal per pound 1.230$     12,300.00$ 1.050$             10,500.00$    1.320$                13,200.00$    0.990$         9,900.00$       1.74$        17,400.00$     

   

TOTAL 12,300.00$ TOTAL 10,500.00$    TOTAL 13,200.00$    TOTAL 9,900.00$       TOTAL 17,400.00$     

WARD Constr. HRM PS Constr FabricsDG Slurry Seal JC Carr


