Project B-1101
Bridge 12-18.25

Sale Date: March 29, 2011 @ 10:00 A.M.

ENGINEER'S B. HILL'Z EXC. ECS SAND RIDGE EXC. ZACHRICH CONST. TAYLOR EXC. ANDERZACK-PITZEN
ESTIMATE Wayne, OH Cleveland, OH Cloverdale, OH Defiance, Oh Delta, OH Metamora, OH
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ref. # ltem # Quantities Unit Description
ROADWAY
1 201 1 L.S. |Clearing & Grubbing 3000.00 3000.00 1700.00 1700.00 2500.00 2500.00 1000.00 1000.00 4000.00 4000.00 2500.00 2500.00 5000.00 5000.00
2 202 47 L.F. |Pipe Removed, 24" & Under 10.00 470.00 2.00 94.00 22.00 1034.00 15.00 705.00 10.00 470.00 8.00 376.00 20.00 940.00
3 202 1 L.S. |Structure Removed, (12-18.25) Over 20' Span 13000.00 13000.00 10100.00 10100.00 11500.00 11500.00 3500.00 3500.00 16000.00 16000.00 12000.00 12000.00 18000.00 18000.00
4 203 336 C.Y. |Excavation 20.00 6720.00 8.00 2688.00 17.00 5712.00 10.00 3360.00 15.00 5040.00 10.00 3360.00 26.00 8736.00
5 203 142 C.Y. |Embankment 20.00 2840.00 9.00 1278.00 37.00 5254.00 10.00 1420.00 15.00 2130.00 10.00 1420.00 20.00 2840.00
6 203 100 S.Y. |Subgrade Compaction 3.00 300.00 2.00 200.00 3.00 300.00 1.00 100.00 2.00 200.00 1.00 100.00 1.00 100.00
7 517 75 L.F. Railing, (Deep Beam Rail w/Steel Tubular Backup
& Type "2" Posts & Anchor Bolts) 90.00 6750.00 80.00 6000.00 45.00 3375.00 86.70 6502.50 66.00 4950.00 82.00 6150.00 80.00 6000.00
8 606 56.25 L.F. |Guardrail, Type "5", (As per Plan) 40.00 2250.00 32.00 1800.00 46.00 2587.50 44.80 2520.00 36.80 2070.00 44.00 2475.00 30.00 1687.50
TOTAL ROADWAY 35330.00 23860.00 32262.50 19107.50 34860.00 28381.00 43303.50
EROSION CONTROL
9 601 154 C.Y. |Rock Channel Protection, Type "D", w/o Filter, 50.00 7700.00 40.00 6160.00 80.00 12320.00 40.00 6160.00 53.00 8162.00 41.00 6314.00 60.00 9240.00
TOTAL EROSION CONTROL 7700.00 6160.00 12320.00 6160.00 8162.00 6314.00 9240.00
DRAINAGE
10 503 1 L.S. |Unclassified Excavation 10000.00 10000.00 8670.00 8670.00 14895.00 14895.00 4200.00 4200.00 11600.00 11600.00 22244.00 22244.00 7500.00 7500.00
11 512 37 S.Y. |Membrane Waterproofing, Type "2" 20.00 740.00 23.00 851.00 29.00 1073.00 19.80 732.60 17.00 629.00 25.00 925.00 17.00 629.00
12 512 114 S.Y. |Membrane Waterproofing, Type "3" 25.00 2850.00 33.00 3762.00 43.00 4902.00 34.20 3898.80 18.00 2052.00 35.00 3990.00 29.00 3306.00
13 603 20 L.F. |8" Conduit, Type E, 707.32 25.00 500.00 12.00 240.00 47.00 940.00 9.00 180.00 16.00 320.00 25.00 500.00 15.00 300.00
14 603 15 L.F. ]24" Conduit, Type E, 707.33 50.00 750.00 30.00 450.00 94.00 1410.00 35.00 525.00 60.00 900.00 65.00 975.00 45.00 675.00
15 603 1 L.S. |Conduit, Type "A", 706.051, Precast Reinforced
Concrete 3-Sided Flat Topped Culvert (28' Span
x 13.75' Rise, 30° Skew) to include all Footings
& Wingwalls (As per Plan) 150150.00 150150.00 118320.00 118320.00 0.00 0.00 145080.00 145080.00 128488.00 128488.00 123601.00 123601.00 134400.00 134400.00
16 Spec. 75 L.F. |Drip Strip 11.00 825.00 8.00 600.00 15.00 1125.00 12.00 900.00 10.00 750.00 12.00 900.00 12.00 900.00
TOTAL DRAINAGE 165815.00 132893.00 24345.00 155516.40 144739.00 153135.00 147710.00
PAVEMENT
17 301 57 C.Y. |Bituminous Aggregate Base, AC-20 250.00 14250.00 155.00 8835.00 250.00 14250.00 172.50 9832.50 165.00 9405.00 180.00 10260.00 220.00 12540.00
18 304 16 C.Y. |Aggregate Base 55.00 880.00 44.00 704.00 223.00 3568.00 35.00 560.00 50.00 800.00 70.00 1120.00 40.00 640.00
19 407 42 Gal. |Tack Coat 3.50 147.00 11.00 462.00 3.00 126.00 11.50 483.00 10.00 420.00 13.00 546.00 2.00 84.00
20 448 22 C.Y. |Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 250.00 5500.00 206.00 4532.00 269.00 5918.00 230.00 5060.00 185.00 4070.00 220.00 4840.00 225.00 4950.00
TOTAL PAVEMENT 20777.00 14533.00 23862.00 15935.50 14695.00 16766.00 18214.00
MISCELLANEOUS
21 614 1 L.S. [|Maintaining Traffic 2000.00 2000.00 1500.00 1500.00 2625.00 2625.00 4000.00 4000.00 2500.00 2500.00 6000.00 6000.00 1000.00 1000.00
22 623 1 L.S. [Construction Layout Stakes 1800.00 1800.00 1350.00 1350.00 2290.00 2290.00 1375.00 1375.00 2000.00 2000.00 3000.00 3000.00 1200.00 1200.00
23 624 1 L.S. |Mobilization 3500.00 3500.00 4500.00 4500.00 6000.00 6000.00 4000.00 4000.00 4000.00 4000.00 3000.00 3000.00 5000.00 5000.00
24 103.05 1 L.S. |Contract Performance & Payment Bond 3078.00 3078.00 2000.00 2000.00 5000.00 5000.00 5000.00 5000.00 2900.00 2900.00 6000.00 6000.00 3500.00 3500.00
TOTAL MISCELLANEOUS 10378.00 9350.00 15915.00 14375.00 11400.00 18000.00 10700.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID 240000.00 186796.00 108704.50 211094.40 213856.00 222596.00 229167.50
1 L.S. |ALTERNATE BID
Conduit, Type A, Cast-In-Place Reinf. Conc.
3-Sided Flat Topped Culvert on Conc. Footings,
28' Span x 13.75' Rise, (28' Clear Span) 0°
Skew to include all footings & wingwalls (as
per plan) No Bid 87029.50 87029.50 145080.00 145080.00 No Bid No Bid 131222.50 131232.50
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID 195734.00 211094.40 226000.00




Project B-1101
Bridge 12-18.25
Sale Date: March 29, 2011 @ 10:00 A.M.

ENGINEER'S ED KELLY & SONS L.J. Irving & Sons HEER EXC. VERNON NAGEL MILLER BROS.
ESTIMATE Toledo, OH Napoleon, OH Archbold, OH Napoleon, OH Archbold, Oh
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ref. # ltem # Quantities Unit Description
ROADWAY
1 201 1 L.S. |Clearing & Grubbing 3000.00 3000.00 2000.00 2000.00 1000.00 1000.00 5000.00 5000.00 2500.00 2500.00 3100.00 3100.00
2 202 47 L.F. |Pipe Removed, 24" & Under 10.00 470.00 10.00 470.00 8.25 387.75 14.00 658.00 5.00 235.00 15.00 705.00
3 202 1 L.S. |Structure Removed, (12-18.25) Over 20' Span 13000.00 13000.00 18000.00 18000.00 15000.00 15000.00 10000.00 10000.00 10000.00 10000.00 18000.00 18000.00
4 203 336 C.Y. |Excavation 20.00 6720.00 20.00 6720.00 8.15 2738.40 15.00 5040.00 10.00 3360.00 15.00 5040.00
5 203 142 C.Y. |Embankment 20.00 2840.00 10.00 1420.00 14.00 1988.00 15.00 2130.00 10.00 1420.00 15.00 2130.00
6 203 100 S.Y. |Subgrade Compaction 3.00 300.00 2.00 200.00 4.00 400.00 1.00 100.00 2.00 200.00 3.50 350.00
7 517 75 L.F. |Railing, (Deep Beam Rail w/Steel Tubular Backup
& Type "2" Posts & Anchor Bolts) 90.00 6750.00 73.00 5475.00 130.00 9750.00 73.00 5475.00 75.00 5625.00 72.20 5415.00
8 606 56.25 L.F. |Guardrail, Type "5", (As per Plan) 40.00 2250.00 37.00 2081.25 0.00 0.00 37.00 2081.25 38.00 2137.50 36.80 2070.00
TOTAL ROADWAY 35330.00 36366.25 31264.15 30484.25 25477.50 36810.00
EROSION CONTROL
9 601 154 C.Y. |Rock Channel Protection, Type "D", w/o Filter, 50.00 7700.00 50.00 7700.00 48.00 7392.00 45.00 6930.00 50.00 7700.00 55.00 8470.00
TOTAL EROSION CONTROL 7700.00 7700.00 7392.00 6930.00 7700.00 8470.00
DRAINAGE
10 503 1 L.S. |Unclassified Excavation 10000.00 10000.00 10000.00 10000.00 3000.00 3000.00 15000.00 15000.00 20000.00 20000.00 35000.00 35000.00
11 512 37 S.Y. |Membrane Waterproofing, Type "2" 20.00 740.00 30.00 1110.00 25.13 929.81 17.00 629.00 12.00 444.00 20.00 740.00
12 512 114 S.Y. |Membrane Waterproofing, Type "3" 25.00 2850.00 35.00 3990.00 25.25 2878.50 22.00 2508.00 25.00 2850.00 25.00 2850.00
13 603 20 L.F. |8" Conduit, Type E, 707.32 25.00 500.00 30.00 600.00 29.86 597.20 30.00 600.00 10.00 200.00 20.00 400.00
14 603 15 L.F. ]|24" Conduit, Type E, 707.33 50.00 750.00 45.00 675.00 63.80 957.00 52.00 780.00 30.00 450.00 50.00 750.00
15 603 1 L.S. Conduit, Type "A", 706.051, Precast Reinforced
Concrete 3-Sided Flat Topped Culvert (28' Span
x 13.75' Rise, 30° Skew) to include all Footings
& Wingwalls (As per Plan) 150150.00 150150.00 128000.00 128000.00 142000.00 142000.00 145000.00 145000.00 158000.00 158000.00 136000.00 136000.00
16 Spec. 75 L.F. |Drip Strip 11.00 825.00 10.00 750.00 20.75 1556.25 8.50 637.50 10.00 750.00 12.00 900.00
TOTAL DRAINAGE 165815.00 145125.00 151918.76 165154.50 182694.00 176640.00
PAVEMENT
17 301 57 C.Y. |Bituminous Aggregate Base, AC-20 250.00 14250.00 165.00 9405.00 168.00 9576.00 170.00 9690.00 168.00 9576.00 150.00 8550.00
18 304 16 C.Y. |Aggregate Base 55.00 880.00 50.00 800.00 37.66 602.56 48.00 768.00 50.00 800.00 60.00 960.00
19 407 42 Gal. |Tack Coat 3.50 147.00 2.00 84.00 2.00 84.00 2.00 84.00 2.00 84.00 10.00 420.00
20 448 22 C.Y. [Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 250.00 5500.00 325.00 7150.00 181.00 3982.00 330.00 7260.00 181.00 3982.00 200.00 4400.00
TOTAL PAVEMENT 20777.00 17439.00 14244.56 17802.00 14442.00 14330.00
MISCELLANEOUS
21 614 1 L.S. |Maintaining Traffic 2000.00 2000.00 7000.00 7000.00 6500.00 6500.00 1500.00 1500.00 2500.00 2500.00 5000.00 5000.00
22 623 1 L.S. |Construction Layout Stakes 1800.00 1800.00 3000.00 3000.00 3000.00 3000.00 2000.00 2000.00 2500.00 2500.00 1125.00 1125.00
23 624 1 L.S. [|Mobilization 3500.00 3500.00 5000.00 5000.00 7500.00 7500.00 6000.00 6000.00 4000.00 4000.00 10000.00 10000.00
24 103.05 1 L.S. |Contract Performance & Payment Bond 3078.00 3078.00 7000.00 7000.00 7000.00 7000.00 2500.00 2500.00 4000.00 4000.00 1500.00 1500.00
TOTAL MISCELLANEOUS 10378.00 22000.00 24000.00 12000.00 13000.00 17625.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID 240000.00 228630.25 228819.47 232370.75 243313.50 253875.00
1 L.S. |ALTERNATE BID
Conduit, Type A, Cast-In-Place Reinf. Conc.
3-Sided Flat Topped Culvert on Conc. Footings,
28' Span x 13.75' Rise, (28' Clear Span) 0°
Skew to include all footings & wingwalls (as
per plan) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID




